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Product Name
ClearPath™ 
Turnkey Radio Control Packages for 
Low Energy Doors

Contact Information
MS SEDCO
8701 Castle Park Drive
Indianapolis, IN  46256
Phone: (317) 842-2545
www.mssedco.com

Product Description
BASIC USE
The ClearPath Turnkey Radio 
Control Packages contain 
switches, transmitters, 
surface-mounting boxes, and 
receivers for common low energy 
automatic openings.  Each 
package is supplied in one 
convenient carton.

ClearPath Package #1

CTP-H: 
 2-59-H; 2-CP/TX; 1-CP/RX
CTP-HSS:
 2-59-HSS; 2-CP/TX; 1-CP/RX
CTP-P:
 2-59-P; 2-CP/TX; 1-CP/RX

ClearPath Package #2

CTP-HJ: 
 1-59-H; 1-59J; 1-CP/TX; 
 1-CP/RX
CTP-HSSJ:
 1-59-HSS; 1-59J-HSS; 1-CP/TX;
 1-CP/RX
CTP-PJ:
 1-59-P; 1-59J-P; 1-CP/TX; 
 1-CP/RX

ClearPath Vestibule Package #3

CTP-HV: 
 2:59-H; 2:CP/STX; 1:59V-H; 
 1:CP/TX-V; 2:CP/RX
CTP-HSSV:
 2:59-HSS; 2:CP/STX;   
1:59V-HSS; 1-CP/TX-V; 2:CP/RX
CTP-PV:
 2:59-P; 2:CP/STX; 1:59V-P; 
 1:CP/TX-V; 2:CP/RX

ClearPath Vestibule Package #4

CTP-H4: 
 3-59-H; 3-CP/TX; 2-CP/RX
CTP-HSS4:
 3-59-HSS; 3-CP/TX; 2-CP/RX
CTP-P4:
 3-59-P; 3-CP/TX; 2-CP/RX

ClearPath Vestibule Package #5

CTP-H5: 
 2:59-H; 1:59V-H; 2-CP/TX; 
 1:CP/TX-V; 2:CP/RX
CTP-HSS5:
 2:59-HSS; 1:59V-HSS; 2-CP/TX; 
 1-CP/TX-V; 2:CP/RX
CTP-P5:
 2:59-P; 1:59V-P; 2-CP/TX; 
 1:CP/TX-V; 2:CP/RX

Technical Data
See individual product data sheets 
for detailed technical data.

DIMENSIONS
See individual product data sheets 
for dimensional information.

APPLICABLE STANDARDS
American National Standards 
Institute (ANSI) - Building 
Hardware Manufacturers 
Association (BHMA) - ANSI/BHMA 
A156.10 & A156.19.

APPROVALS
See individual product data sheets 
for approvals.

Availability & Cost
AVAILABILITY
Available internationally from 
manufacturer’s authorized 
distributors; contact MS SEDCO 
for the location of nearest 
distributor.

COST
Cost information on MS SEDCO 
products is available from the 
manufacturer’s authorized 
distributors.

Warranty
See individual product data sheets 
for warranty information.

Maintenance
MS SEDCO recommends that all 
maintenance and adjustments be 
performed by an AAADM Certified 
Technician.

Technical Services
MS SEDCO’s staff of factory 
trained sales and service 
personnel offer design assistance 
and technical support.  Local 
distributors are also available to 
assist in selecting appropriate 
devices for specific uses and to 
provide onsite installation.
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ClearPath™ Radio Control Switches  
with HDRC™ solve problems caused  
by interference and stray signals —  
and are guaranteed to work where  
others won't.  
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